T €. S1.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

1.5, -31.Te1.-31.-19092023-248823
CG-DL -E-19092023-248823

HATHTIT
EXTRAORDINARY

AT 1 1—EueE 4
PART Il1—Section 4

TR & THTIT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

T. 643] 7% feehY, ArwraTe, s 18, 2023/91 27, 1945
No. 643] NEW DELHI, MONDAY, SEPTEMBER 18, 2023/BHADRA 27, 1945

TR FRaTeT S <Tre Teqwar 91
AT
T2 foeett, 18 fawar |, 2023
TR feamar i srre sreqwar ai€ (et saraartae) (ga |@9me)
fafm=w, 2023

e 1. t.311./2023-24 /5. T /31T 3. 5. 104 —rediy fRamar i onvae sraraar e, fRarar

T oTTe SreAwar "igar, 2016 (2016 T 31) T &1 240 % AT Ifod &7 196, =T 206, o<1 207
AT gT 208 FRT Y& ARRAT & YANT Fd g0, AR Qarar sfiT oed stawar are (fRarar
FTaaTa®) AfFaE, 2016 F7 3w gerrga Fw & forw Fefofaa &= a=mar g, stiq -

1. (1) 39 RAfA=Er #1 gferm am s fRarer s age stawar are (e smeaEs) (@
Terrae) fafH=m, 2023 2 1

(2) T TSI | THTH T AT T TG BT |
2. AT Tt i ofver sterwar a1 (e =maattw) @fFa, 2016 (2 2o o 7
e [ R ) H,
(1) fafe=w 5 % @< (@) ¥, “ATHIEA & TATq & qeat & TArq “FAfaaw 6 F orefiw sty sread
I F FaTT Y A a9 oF Hae” ores siaseriua R ST |
(2) BT 6 ¥, -

5925 G1/2023 Q)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

(i) ST-Faf==w (1) % v 9, Fefeted I9-AAEs w@r S, oiq-

“(1) Freft fameT st uSiHEr F 9 SATaETiiE g9 F €9 § AT #is AT,
39 feaTeT =raartd USiEt & AreAw ¥, Newr 98 9997 g, 91 f o9 g ®9I7 hHl
AT ATEET I A1 34 [AHFAT 6 AL ATLAT & T8 & & AN-Il § AaaT w7
AT |7

(ii) Su-faf{=w (17) F e+ w7, et so-EREs T S, aoiqQ-

“(1) fafa=w 4 F su-faffaw (2) F s g =T F =7 § e F oo
T Fre RETeT SmEeTtE qeem, Y fREer saertE qeer F qreaw |9, S g
3T g, a1 Hl, 39 [AF|l 6 A AqgAT 6 T&T FF & 9=l 7, a7 1@ =G0 6
vt smaed 9 Tf2d, s w T

(iiy  SU-REFEw (2) # “TIS” 957 F T I “TaaTaT SATaaTHH Usiel” 9768 TG S0,

(iv)  Su-faf==w (2) * T, FMatated ST-AAE st G ST, -

“(2%) feaTeT =mEETaE usHT, FATedta, sY-AtHaw (1) a1 su-fHaw (19F) & 9+
I T I FA T arE 7 A9 7T F AT smaeT i qeartud i 3% 91 #°y ¥
FM, SEH T fREmer SmEertas uSHr gy ATEETaE 955wl 7RI, Safafisn
TEATAS, SITAHRTET T FTSTHTOT T Fee o for7 (2T 727 787 gre == o 17

(3) fafaam 7 & su-fafa=rm (1) #, “are fea” a=ai & e uw A fiq” ores @ S
(4) FfF=w 8 & Iu-fafa=w (2) ®, “45 " it o< ore o TTH U “dig fa=” oreg T AT0Ar;
(5) fafere 10 #,
() 3u-fafa=w (1) #, @ (7) F 7a7q, Fefrieg g s By ST, seaiQ-
“(F) FEEAAT o TFIUI % {oIT ST TFHT FIAT 8 ST A Toreed] § ATTAIAF g3
T ATH Tl ¢
(F) SATAATIAF TET Hl ACHRTiEa FdT & a1

(®) =t =8 i gog 71 Fot, ffHa T ariErT 31 IoESd w9 & qET 3qT
ferereT =T FEAT STH AT g 3T 9 Toreesl | &, SATIET I 92 HT 779 FHredl g 17

(@) 3u-fafa=w (2) #, “Are FEM" =11 F T, ST a8 39+ @< (F), @< (A) X &2 () &
e Amwet & forw, afe vET w347 gHi=E G707 S0 ar @fEEE 10" F A fEdarar O 90
T BT ST |
(6) fafa=m 10 & waq, FMaferfea A siaenfog B sor, saiq:-

“10%. TITEISHTOT THTOTT T ¥Iqor

(1) FTE fE@TaT SATEETEF, IS &, G TTE w20l TR Jigd foled o Tre FTh 9
TISTEETHTOT THTOTT T ST¥AT7 FT FHT |




[¢TRT [11—EUE 4] T T TSI © T 3

(2) =t S T TUTLTH BT SATAT & a7 98 ITeht IfH & | foq % fiqe doedisor o=
T o 7T STy T TR FT TRAT A TR FE A T UH ATAT SATTETIAS T TSTEL R0 T
&1 ST |

(3) TIRTEEHTOT THTTTH o TZHIOT hl qTIE & Haterd =afh UH fhamshema &3 & forg, e forg
THT THTOTTS STa FohaT ST o, ST9= ST &l THTOYS 3 4T & &7 § T&qd qgl He |
109. Irvadur, A snfe u Fiars & oo Aoy giwar

(1) arE, == fafF=m % sreft amwer &1 FRoerr w39 au, B 11 8§ R g g aes
N

(2) arE, fafF=m 10 % IT-RfFET (1) F @ (3) 3T @ (F) % AT FFA1 79 g 0w, I
FUTerd g1, UH ATFATAF qaed | Tg W Fd gU Aed ST FT T o ag e0g ¢ & &t &
T STaT TSTEETH 0T THTUTIS &l T2 FA1 gl [6AT ST AT 0 |

(3) SATFATAF T, AIfeq HT qrHIA HF qE T THE & T 9T qafy F faw ot
AT T T |

(4) 9T, IT-FAFFH (3) F AT T T o & dqF i T, TSI H TE FT AT 91
FATEAHE T T A 6 29 T FA, dfad Aqaradi, S daa 6e #7 §ar7 A7 g, e &1
[EIRECRETS: e

(5) T, IU-Taf=w (4) e srv=T o, su-fafRaw (3) * s forfera e s g &t
AT § A e & Ay dgf=d Fa |

(6) faff=w 10 & Su-fafa=w (1) F @ () F = =71 I g9 T, UH farer ety &1
IS o ITH TIOTEL IR0, FATEAT, ZEATALOT AT qHTIA AT farered it ariie & T g1 T4T THAT JTUT |

(7) == A= % 72| TEor IO & TEHT i e ¥, fRarar s & EAfeed
T AT FAISAAT, UE et Af¥era a1 aearest a1 iEadt & afare & forw, S & e stswear an
=T ® 21 oed €, 39 gua Aty F ofiaw i 39 Ofa §, S gEwa B[Rt F e sfer g ar Ser
are g [Aeer ey stto, st=a wew oo 17
3. W Faf=dT &t g8 AT §, T F F €79 92 Heffead I89 T@r STus, S@idq -

“TEq F
THIFA ATHIHT 3T TR AraaT I
[Tt faamaT siw otrere sterwar are (fRarar sgmaatEe) Efaae, 2016 9w 6 v 9T

faTeT i< otrere sreryar (smeet fAfert v farer s vSifet #1 ot a1€) fAff=we, 2016 %

T 10 F srefim)
AT
[sTaEe gIRT weqa fahar STy FIAT T &l
FaT A, FT TS
waper T, ATRTT T HIET
EEIEIRIECIPERE LIk 1E)) IERETLY

o ST geer F €9 ¥ AT o Rarer sraatiEE F Teedier F o srag |
HETA/FEIT,
-1

(m’)Wﬁmmaﬁgﬁaﬁaw(mﬁﬁﬁﬁaﬁ?ﬁmwm@ﬁﬁwmﬁaﬁ)
fafRewe, 2016 * fafaaw 10 % s (fRaren =ara@TET oS #71 9m9) # =Eards qeeg F &9 §

ATHTR; 3T



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

(&) AT fRaTeT i onvere srermar are (e sameartaF) Bff=ae, 2016 F fAfFaw 6 F =
afed fearaT s omerd sterwar |i2ar, 2016 T &m=T 207 F = QAT SATaE TS & €9 § TR

% forT sraas Fear g |
7 =T Rt =9 7 2:-
F. TAREF AT
1. Tt (/e /aef/ars o)
2. ATH (49/3TLTE 3 ATHTY)
3. 94T &7 amH:
4. WTAT HT ATH:
5. S¥H T ara:
6. STFH-EATH:
7.9
8. YT . (T2 ITAH ) :
9. ITHIIE HEITh (TS ITeH §)
10. STT.UH.E1.3E. 0. (TR ST B)
11. .32 0. /3. 9318 UL (T 1T Suersy ) ¢
12. TF-EAER & oI oaT (A1 38 TS 9d & &9 § strwferterd fHam som):
13. eIt 74T
14, T T4T: (12 T T ishd S8 Iq o =9 § srfaferfera frm smom):
15. HrETE A, : (12 37 TTEFd qrarsa o, % &9 7 syt B som):
16. ATATET YTRATT : 9 § A =afw/vd § arge Famt SAfh (ST @0 7 87 39 e &) [fRamr
o7 Tt srerTaT |f2dT, 2016 Fit T 3(24) AT 4T 3(25) F FEEATTEE] ;
g, SIary;: dfer, SATaaTEE i feamar ader sgare
(i) Qfer srgard
[T d=rere =3 & o Qifers® srgarat 7 A7 4

w0 | oferw gt/ SO A F AT | yraye (%) | Sofy/Et fooofy, ot

M 1@ 3) (4) (5) (6) (7)




[T [1—=vE 4]

HTLT =T TSI AT

(ii) =rTerETR® srEard [fRare =meaTtas EfREt & ffFe 5 )(iv) F e

A | FTEET | e/ HIETT ./ TR/ A | feerft, 7t
.| AT ATHRA &(ST | A T
#T AL A
(1) 12 3) (4) (5) (6)
(iii) f=maT srgard
A | wfguEEET FT BT ATAT | e/ w1 | 6 (%) SOl F | feoft,
qo A R | A St (afy | TS gﬁ" I
AT 2T)
(1) 1) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7)
1. | #ifaa famer ars Y. frare
qaeT
2. | |TqswE feErar
EIRER]
3. | g fRamer
EIRER]
(iv) FAT 3T TSTELIha Jediwa 52 (i/A8))
Tfe gf, a1 -
(F) <. AT aT. e, TSE R .
(@) TEE T qeaiheh S5 (AT ATLEAT.) T 1 3,

(3T) ST AT 3. AT .

T. FR AT

OERIEIEREIEERIECCTERIE LK E A CIECLIERIEE)!
(ii) ST & T srafer (AWt 2 O /i H): TU/AE
(iii) TSI ¥ o srafer (AWt &7 qof /4t #): au/Ae
(iv) STHT &1 SART (T B F Tamq/amer B F varqEmasmay M & T4 Afeaw/ares

HHTSES/FHIAT TIHF/ATTT TGTHRTE & €T § ATHTHA il qTEE o)

| aRME | aE IGRIEG BIETL Eap
q@. | (R (A &
Fu)F | TH ST | T | srfergmrady /A e [ T AT S w
T AH iR e TISTES R HeTTh
T Tar Tf = 2
(1| (@) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7) (8)




6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

. AfAR=s STt
1. FAT AT FAT TRt sraerer 3 for St T @ 22 (81/A=0)
7t g, 91 FoaT aaaW ufa afgg s @ |
2. T AT % TS AT FEAT! Afad &2 (F/AR)
7t g, T FoaT aaaW Rufa afgqg s
3. FAT AT et AT IT/9TTe STeqH ATl 6T 797 22 (27./7%1)
T3 27, a1 FUAT Faa i afga @ swr 3 |

4. F7 oo ey wr At uars, s uaens., ae e (arE), i afveg a1 s &
Tl AqATHAE FAATET ATad & AT el T FuT H el T80T 396 1T A0 [A5g His Aqemas

FEATE T TE 272 (/=)

7fT g1, A1 F9AT Faa Rafq afgq AT |

5. FAT ATI FHHT TRt fRaTeaT AEaTET USHET & 9 T8 & o0 e BHar g2(g/Ag)
7f% g, a1 FaaT AT

Araa i e

TS dT.U. w7 AT

e it fRafq

AR FHA T AL, TS AR BT

AR FHA ol G, TS AR &l

6. FIAT Frs UHT ATATh STHHT &, ST TH a1 A7 AT Fed o (o0 GEIT g 1o FIT T ITLH AT
st efte § |

1. ATATH T T it ITT |
2. U9 FTE, AT FTE 3T ITEITE il I |
3. it o & TR yToTas i aid |

4. .31 0. /ST dT. A U, e o iy v |
5. gfersh sTgar, SATAATAT Agar i< areT arer & gHAT § TEarasl af ST |
6. Meferera =9 # sraam wefeha e arer aearasl sl Jadm —

(i) AT ATES TS HEATT & T TF ATES THTSee;

. o . o o . O N o . o —~
(ii) FTEATT FHAAT T G | TR UF SOt aied;

(iii}) WTEATT ARTT AFTIEE HEATT | TRIEEHA UFh AR AFT3e; AT
(iv) Faferst afvag # ammifha ua srfeen |
7. TSR (RersTent) & fR=rsTe STy S aiaed, e o e i safey fafde g




[¢TRT [11—EUE 4] T T TSI © T 7

8. Toeger e @i =t fa<ia fEeor/amT-F7 azomET |
9. TTELd qedTaa TS 6T SATAET A qEeqdT o THTT T If T |

10. AT T8 STHT/HET FEA AT ATE7 |

11. Frofafs, smoerfass FrAariR, fEare/sied sTewdr e, AAemataT FTAarRdi/Ararsat h arad
STTHRTET T ST & o7 qERTT e o7+ Atk STeeRt<d, S A 21 (s stanta |fer q@r, e
raent At Ife ofie Iweht e Rufa o g) F =47 |

oJS. HL

H g 9T § 3T Y 9gAq g % (Ramem samaettis usiEr #7 9m) F 909 AT S 97| §
TR ROT-0F <ITere TS IIT FHeAT, T TSTE 0 6 [olT ghalT dal aq1dT, ST o #% g AT
faTeT 3 onrere srerHar S (RareT saraatas) FfFaue, 2016 F @y atea g siw ova= srergar
H2aT, 2016 # T AR STUEATSH T SATATAT e o el 7 |

. TR
1. | I8 YA F2ar g & § fGarar i ovae stasar gigar, 2016 it &=r 205 & a1 afod qdiT

TATAT ST oTrere sreqyar are ( emaet fAteaT siv fearar sameattas ustiEr w1 gt are) fAfRaas, 2016
& AT ATIATAT FaeT F & H ATH{H (0T ST HT I Z |

2. § Fg gfas At g & 39 Aaed § AL T TE T8 AERRT J FaaA J A a5
AT FET A IO 2 |

3. § fearar ST ot weqwar wigar, 2016, 39 7t = v [y, fafaamt, s fFo s
fRonfeaent sfiw 9=, 39 fGEmar SAEaras usHr #, Sad § Tithg g, STafei i are ar vHr
feaTaT AT UsiE F oarEt aE g T SEeut s fAu T fAer i SrheATsH A AT wee
S THT e Afa s SRy, S A A v et vsiEH g ste f /it S, seqd e v
FAT AT E |

AT T ATH 3T ITF ZEATAT
LICH
i
T -
HTAETAF 2T G TEIT 36T 1Y
[T sareaTs & &7 7 s F see]

. Rarer srraatR weiEt % T i

(1) SATIATAF qEEIdT |./ATHRT 9.

(2) ATHTRT T AR

T, orermor-qd Afers arsrw

ERUEIKE R ELHERR R SR ICRE R I A R AL ED)

T3 2T, qT T RI0-0F STersh TTSaoH I i a6l aria: f&q/AmE/ay




8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

T. 6 & qa T

FAT AT TSTELTHOT-04 ATeTsh TS IXT e il QI | TF I13g A & HIa¥ a0 & Aqdad
e I &7 91 H AT Z2(3T/A=1)

T2 27, a1 A2 T AVTAT AraT B AT qa1T F Al arira:foa/ama/ad

o, ST T A=A
FAT AT TaTAT SATEATTHF TSTHT o6 T AT 1 ST H 6 (o0 ATaad FI & G0 T F H Te&qd
#¥ TS TR T A=A AT ATZ 2 2(ST/AZ)

. E

1. § g Ifasta F2ar g & # faaren =i e sterwar &f2ar, 2016 #t &y 207 & |1 9foq AT
fareT i onee srergar are (Rarer s=raaEe) [, 2016 F sefiw g saeaas & =7 §

TorEdad o ST T a1 § |

2. § 7g s war g & 39 saed § 7 g 95qd A T2 AR HY Gaad A9 S @+
AT FET A IO 2 |

3. § fearar ST ot reqwar ®igar, 2016, 39+ 1fi9 s=mw wu =i, AfFew, s o 1o
oAt o 9=, 39 feamar saaartas usHr @, Sed § amited g, sufafes «iw are o v
EaTeaT SATEETaE USiHT & omHr are g {u T [er i SAueTe 7 SAquTad T ST UHT &e
Ffas STy, St T are a7 fearer smearies ustEt gy ST #t AR { S0, Teqd 3 F7 999 adT g |

. GATH
1. Freft feaTeT sareaTias vt & T seerar J9eras i uid
2. TSEERor-va Afere qresrawd QT FTA 6 THIIS 6l T |

3. AR HE STHT/EITT FTA HT A1 |
4. &Y F H FAAT il T2 ATHHET Hg TG =l T, ST Tl 9T AT 271
ATT-1ll
fareT ST ToET g e AT ST
[Tt ST & &9 § TEHr F ISET]

qaT ¥,
FETAT Haeren(3rs. 0. T9mT)
AT f2aTeT 3 oes eqvar are

o et =maaRs & w1 7 dodsr ¥ o s

HEISA/ ARG

(ATAEF FT ATH) T ATCAT f@arar sfi¥ oreas srerar are (Rarer samaartas) @fa=aT 2016 +
= 6 & |y afeq fRamar i arae sterwar wi2ar, 2016 it 9T 207 F 1 qaaqr (FATaATaH
HEEAAT HEHTH) TTH Fld & TAT, TR % (7T TTH A&, TIEERT 9IS &l T&qq (haT Aar g |

g % s T o &



[T [1—=vE 4]

HILT T TSI . AHTYTL

. | g
1 T AT9a o T e § aA1s.91. [t & [T 4 %
e fafaTw 5 & ol a7 SAT(TAT-AT) TET F@ra‘rm—«ﬁ%%l
T € ST are . %ﬁmﬁ%ﬁﬁWG%mﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁg
FYAT o AT TSR0 o forw g O o 22
2 FT SATAATAF TG 7 dTS Hl MFad B 6T Gard Fid *® %
TEE AT & HIa¥ TrEraor-qd Afers e 21 a8 gra“rm—aﬁ%e»ﬁ'{
SiY =9 Tay § FraT STHTTS ST ? FAHTL TEATAA &
(Wwaﬁarﬁa)
3 T [3aToT ATIHTHE TS|l o 3aaeh &l (ardT %
STIHTI I o7 qTarar Seeft sTeAr 7 ST it 2T, a1 F9AT /L AT
& TATG ATIETAT TEEIAT T T 572 THATHRTL TEATASA & |
(AT )
(ATHTRT Y TEE)
4 FAT ATTATAF TaeT F [a65 A 8103, BB
e Hr.ua.es,, e Y. uwouens, B3t S Tfe g, 7 =4 3%
AT AT, T, T e 9aey §, Fls AqamEi=s THIAFHTL TETAA & |
FEATE! @ted & AT fOge di aut § T a9 39 Feg
TS AAATHIAF FLATS I T2 872
5 AT TRl (AT T, TS, 61,0318, TS, 81, UH. 0.3 BIRE
e T ue.eme. At fafes qaE T & Tt gT, a1 s34 %
aﬁ%a%w%mmwaﬁ%’w%ﬁw%%%n THATFHIL TETAA & |
S = 2
6 FAT SATIATIAE T ] (Ul HATSTF o 99 a7 ATqAG, qg/
T2 ag RIS # o7, 9@ @1 ar? gra“r—qﬁ'fraﬁ'{wﬁmﬁrﬁ
7 (e SATAATIAE Taed G o1.31%. UA. /3191, 3%, 0. T 2l F@r
AT & T AT e AR TEATH A Whiq | T( g, a1 ST 30T
Tfed Ieht Rofa 1 T fhar @ 22 W?iﬂ?ﬁr&aﬁﬁvr%l
8 FT ATAATAF TG FT ATH HILIIE H1T TATAT & ST ag
H Meferfed & d@ey § e grar & T, 7 SHIT S Ty
%;q—rﬁaf‘aﬁw 2013 #T a7 164 F et Az RETAS &
9T, AT
(u)a-s’sriﬁmaﬁm,mmaﬁawsz%weﬁ?ra@ﬁﬁ
TTHT?
9 FT ATAATTAF TGET Tl HaT AL AT TTTETET ST gg/
g fUser e ot & e frar mar g2 g‘rEﬁwl(lsﬁTdechw
10 FAT SATIHAF TIE FT TH AT 579 /30 4 gg
ST & ATCAT AT o TR AT T TAT | THhe Z1aT 52 T, Eﬁoqlu 3T qHITR
Bl & oI T Wﬂgél
11 FT ATIATAF TG JITY AR L P g/
TAT 22 7f2 &, a1 =41 Y
HHQ"I"hI(I HSIES! %l

A (TS T ATH) I, ST (FEEAAT |.) aTAT gHIT ATTET % 9287 g, Teqd [0 T ITLFT 1 M
qATOd R g AR g I8 #3d & & 9 97 ¥ Agl & | 29 (M= 7 47H) & e a1.1.3ms. § farar
FTAATIAT 6 ®F H TITEa 0T il [IRIeT Fed & |

(AT 3 ZEATER)
TEaTAT SATAETI USTET T I SATerahTr
(EEIEIIECIPERS AR IEL)

T



10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

4. 9o A= AT T ATEAT H, T8 T o €19 2 Mo ieiad &9 T@T ST, .-
“IET Fih

THIFA ATHIHT 3T TSTEHr saa o

[T feameT S avae SerHar (sreet fBfeat i farer smeaartas usifEe #1 ol are) fhew,
2016 F fafa=m 10 =i 9= Ramr 7 avaw sterwar s (Rarar smaartas) @fFage, 2016 +
T 6(1%F) =i F s1efiA)

HATT-1
[smaEe g weqa faRa STy
4T ¥,
Tarer fAere,
(FeaTaT =aTeaTtas ustey &1 977)
o ST 95 % €9 § A R kgt sraani@E & TeediEr & g srag |
LEERILAERI

1., ST o =0 AT G50F BT T TEFT G, o (STAEF HEAT FT 9719) T A< &, ST & 9
FT A=Al H& 1 ............. & AT AT ATFETEE GO AT F ®T H AAAIE 8, e e
1 151 IO (STaTH HEAT T TSEE T TadT) 8, AT FaT g |

(i) AT fRamaT sfiT orreas srerHar e (Ameel At siw fRare smeaart@s vsitaat &1 gt are)
== 2016 F AT 10 F el (RETeT ST TS #7 971) F 979 ATFET9S 9667 & & |
ATHTR; 3T

(ii) AT feaTeT ST arge wewar are (fRamer smEEts) @fFas, 2016 F @faaw 6(17F) F ar
afsd fRaTar i< omrerd sterdar |i24ar, 2016 T &7 207 F refi= fRare T SATaa T & 9 § Tored ishor

% ToIT SreaT Far g |

H UAEgT 39 §9Y H Ga(ATE/ENER F Haheq i JHIO Ii) o7 F2ar g & § 7g saad w77 %
T 3T a1 & 979 39 J19q TA-FHAZRE FLA & (T T g |
SIS IEE TR

1. FFT reraa FeAT Rt o= Faet AT AR AerT &t agrae woet, S S A1 984 67 (F1/78T)
TfT T a1 FoI7 THT FHot A7 Aeiag e st s §

2. FAT AT HEAT F To%g Fre QAT THTem THoRaT 91 T g A7 JadT1e 12 2 2(1/8T)

7t g, T FoaT aaaW ufa afgq s g

3. FAT ATATH HEAT AATHI=T (RaTerar g2(2/A=1)

7f% g, a1 FoaT aaame Rufy afgg s 3

4. FT e geT s, . Afqaet & A 4() F Regargar 39 o7 3t=a =ai=e 22 (1A=




[¢TRT [11—EUE 4] T T TSI © T 11

T3 g7 A7 FI4T IaAE Rafq afgd @ AT § |

5. FT ATaEF HEAT & TATRAT, FAT AiEe a7 e, e, @, @fH=t F fHI 4(8) * FagamEr
S ST 3=a AR 82(81/A%)

TfT 72T, 7 THT STfafi=h STy Y29 FE ST GERTa g1 Fahc 2 |

6. FIAT THT ATA T STHHRTT & ST FETT g1 Thcil 2 |

EIREIGE

(U T (ST HEAT FT 9TH) H A T T TTA=19 Far g o sreash gear 7 o, i, Ffv=wi &
A = 12 3 13 &7 g% 987 squrad AT g |

2. H e, (SMaTF HEAT &7 ATH) Al AL § I AW HaT g (6 e qed1, Raran Aadqras
TSHT & UTH SATIETAF T86T & €9 § Arqifhd 360 S #1977 2 |

T AN (STTaEe |EAT &7 4719) HT A F 7g TA=1 F2ar g 6 —

(i) =9 Taad | siafas Tl ST THT T § 97 37 98l &,

(ii) TH SATART F TITSIATY TERTT Hle ST qATTcash SITHHRT dTE T8l T8 &, 37

(iii}) SH TR F AT | AT ATHHT ad HIeTH B F T2 [6AT ST THT TS THH T8 6l T
Tl ST TRt AT S| 9 qTfcaeh 31 & fo=a7 97 919 91s STl & |

4. ¥, I I FIAT g o A0 FIF TGS TSHET Fl..coeen, (FTAT H2rT U S A aE qied 91 F
T gfae Y) F f3a =@ g & 39 999 H 99d §7 FATE |

5. 7T FEEqT THIOTIT A< AT a7 € al H.......e, (STergeh TEAT T ATH) i T 7 Gigar 39 swefi=
ST o o R, AR 9 oot ar fRarEert o v aer REaat i ot #, S uSsET gy
TEEIAT THTOIS YT 60 ST o F80 I7 386 TATG AT 60 S0, AT i 0 999 <aT g |

T (TeaTaT SATEATA HEAT T ATH.......)

GIRCH (FeaTeT SATaET s ST T ATFIAT H6A1.......)
SEPED
1. FE/ATNERT & 39 g&ed Hl AT 9d, 59 g0 39 ARw F T8 AEed & 7 f&arar
AT TSiHT F T 36 qTad TA-AAGTE FLA & [oIT TTTerhd 7aT a7 ¢ |

2. dTE gIT ST |qT=dT THTor9= iy If |

3. Jraed tﬁ’ﬂ’\ﬂ"ll/%idlq h{d Rl 91T



12 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

AT -
EIERIPE R S AR IS CRE RIS
[fReer srraETiAT % &7 # TSETor & g
ST T A=A (T ST
1. FAT 3T TS, 9.0, 3 T ATHTHRA T STHT F & (oI sraae Fed 980T T&T & § TEd 6l T8
ST T STIA FEAT ATed 2 2(FT/7=1)

RiEEau

1. & (Feamem Arearias ST &7 A19) & &7 § g Tas" F:2ar g 4 GErer Samaartas qe1 § adT
faTaT ST otrem sterHar are (feamar =meartaF) AfFawe, 2016 (e d. @) & & 12 s
=T 13 7 g7 J9T Ut AT g

2. § (fRarem SATE|TRF ST F7 °7H) & AT & I TS AT g (o (Qarar ATaaTas €7 a0 & T
fEaTaT SHTaETEE & ®9 H TReiad o0 S 6 I g |

3. § (FRaTerr ATaATH AT T ATH) 6T AL F Tg TTAATT T g 1% —
(i) =9 e | siafas gt STt Tt T F 97 37 98l g,
(ii) TH SATAR F TATSIHATYS TERTT HI5 AT qTicash SR [@aTE qal T2 8, AT

(iii}) =9 ST o AT | T 7T TAT TOEE R0 a9 §ier €9 8 T 36T 7 70T afs 28949
TEQT T TS Tl AT THET T SorH 92 qTfcash 318 & f=a7 37 919 qTE ST g |

(iv) TeameT =mEaTs Jer it JTFar T i ST Tl ATS THE T A TS AT SATHHT AT
AT TH 9 qicash e | FH=am a7 9 a1 STt 2 |
4. ®, 78 I FaT § o a6 6F 1 F&F a1 Fl....eeeen, (FIAT G2 0 9 6T qRE qied §aF &
ST g &Y) FT 33T T § ST 39 99 H 99q g7 F:aT g |
5. Ffq TISTELIHTOT THTO SR AT AT g al H..e (SMTeET EAT FT A1) HI AT & igar 396
el S b o R, Rt a7 gt o RenfRcent s v srew Ryt i ot &1, S A g
TR JHTOTTS T (o0 ST o T80T AT I TAT SAE9d o0 1T, ST FH Al a4 <dl
gl

e

TTferRd geaTersanal
(TH)
(TATH)

o o o N . .
(IGGIIQ'II TIATIR Tl UASTE R &ITF...... )

AT (FeaTarT =ATaaTas SeT &7 A79.......)

qeIE: (FeaTaT SATAET I HEAT T AAAT 96T1.......)
LEPED

1. STS/TIET % 39 Hehed st JHTor I, fSreer g1 39 =3f<h &l g Adad F3d A 9IS & 979 39

AT TA-AAGTE FLA o [T TTTehd HaT AT ¢ |




[¢TRT [11—EUE 4] T T TSI © T 13

2. feareT sraa R vt g s R T aeear gurores £ gf

3. AN hIH STHT/EET FHLd & 9167 |
4. &Y T § FAT T TS ATHHRTLT Hg TG T T, ST Tl 9 AR 2T |
-1
fRaTaT SATFETRT THET g7 TR A1 ST
[Rarer st & w7 § Tordaor & Tarsm]

TaT A,
FraaTers e (s dY. T9TT)
AT fRaTeT 3T oes eqqar are

R feameT ST F €7 § T F g e

CHERTE R ERI

(AT TG HT ATH) T AT R@TeT 3w ovee sterwar are (Rarer smEartas) ffaaa
2016 & 7w 6(1%) F A7 qfsa faaraT T oves sterwar gigar, 2016 H¥ gy 207 F Fefie Faegar
(FATAATIIS HEETAT T ) STH e o THT, TSI H0T o (o0 STH TaA, UGG dle Hl Teqd (AT
STar g |
2. A ATAATAF Taed (AT FT 919) FT, ST (SATIHTAF q2eqqT §.) qTAT gHIRT SATIHTAF
AT g, T [0 T ST T FATIH < A7 § | 39 I8 I F3d g o6 —

(i) TEAT 3, AE AT AAEA AUTUT FLA HT qIE Hl FAT-FE=HA, TTR T, WiETe AT
IGESERA

(ii) TEAT, AT @ 7 srerHar are (farar sraaEE) Ffaame, 2016 F @AfFaw 12 6w
= 13 % T SATerhtara aT=rar Sereft SToeATsti &7 ST el g |
3. H (ATIETIAF T&ET T ATH) F TS & T QAT SATIATF F T H Toea 1207 it [RTier F3d |

(AT 3T gEaTE)

feaTaT SATaETiE UStEt FT ATted STty

(FeaTeT =TaET I ST i 7igY)
T
SIRAECH

i foer, srewer

[FAr=TTaT-111/4/376T./425/2023-24]

faroquer : el fRETe i o steraT A (ReareT smaetaen) fAfRee, 2016, S F TeTE, S,
qART I, @< 4, . 424, qEE@ 23 dFFEy, 2016 ¥ Ateg=«r €. ore.&1a.s1E./2016-

17/501.0./312 2 50,003, ae 23 FaTa, 2016 gT TR fohT 0 o o 399 ifaw gotres
AR & T, STETER, 9Rr |, T 4, §. 507, q@ 20 A1, 2023 H ArEEE=Ar
T, 3. & 1.A1.31M./2023-24 57,07 /312 2 51,103, a181@ 20 ﬂ?ﬂé’, 2023 T TR AT feamerr
S oTrere sterar a1 (Feamer saraattae) (Ferre) fafaam, 2023 g o)




14 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

INSOLVENCY AND BANKRUPTCY BOARD OF INDIA
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 18th September 2023
Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency Professionals) (Second Amendment) Regulations, 2023

No. IBB1/2023-24/GN/REG104.—In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 196, 206, 207 and 208
read with section 240 of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Code, 2016 (31 of 2016), the Insolvency and Bankruptcy
Board of India hereby makes the following regulations further to amend the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of
India (Insolvency Professionals) Regulations, 2016, namely: -

1. (1) These regulations may be called the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency Professionals)
(Second Amendment) Regulations, 2023.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency Professionals) Regulations, 2016 (hereinafter referred
to as ‘the principal regulations’),

(1) in regulation 5, in clause (b), after the words “pre-registration educational course”, the words “within twelve
months from the date of payment of non-refundable application fee under regulation 6 ~, shall be inserted.

(2) in regulation 6,
(i) for sub-regulation (1), the following sub-regulation shall be substituted, namely: -

“(1) An individual enrolled with an insolvency professional agency as a professional member may
make an application to the Board through the insolvency professional agency of which he is a
member, in Part — Il of Form A of the Second Schedule to these Regulations, along with a non-
refundable application fee of twenty thousand rupees to the Board.”

(ii) for sub-regulation (1A), the following sub-regulation shall be substituted, namely: -

“(1A) An insolvency professional entity eligible for registration as an insolvency professional under
sub-regulation (2) of regulation 4 may make an application to the Board through the insolvency
professional agency of which it is a member, in Part — Il of Form AA of Second Schedule to these
Regulations, along with a non-refundable application fee of two lakh rupees to the Board.”

(iii) in sub-regulation (2), for the word ‘“Board,” the words “insolvency professional agency” shall be
substituted.

(iv) after sub-regulation (2), the following sub-regulation shall be inserted, namely: -

“(2A) The insolvency professional agency shall verify and forward the application to the Board
within thirty days from the date of payment of fee under sub-regulations (1) or (1A), as the case
may be, excluding the time given by the insolvency professional agency to the professional
member for submitting additional documents, information, or clarification, as the case may be.”

(3) inregulation 7, in sub-regulation (1) for the words “sixty days” the words “thirty days” shall be substituted.

(4) in regulation 8, in sub-regulation (2) for the words “forty five days” the words “thirty days” shall be
substituted.

(5) inregulation 10,
(a) insub-regulation (1),
i. in clause (c), the word “or” shall be omitted.
ii. after clause (d), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely: -

“(e) accepts the application for surrender of membership and strikes the name of the
professional member from its registers;

(f) expels the professional member; or

(9) receives intimation of demise of an individual or winding up or dissolution of a company,
limited liability partnership or registered partnership firm and strikes the name of the
professional member from its registers.”



[¢TRT [11—EUE 4] T T TSI © T 15

(b)

in sub-regulation (2), after the words, bracket and figure “sub-regulation (1)”, the words “and for cases
referred to in clauses (e), (f) and (g) thereof, it may, if deems expedient to do so, proceed in accordance
with regulation 10B”, shall be inserted.

(6) After regulation 10, the following regulations shall be inserted, namely: -
“10A. Surrender of certificate of registration.

€]
O]

@)

10B.

@
O]

®)
(4)

®)
(6)

()

An insolvency professional may surrender its certificate of registration by making a request to the
Board, in writing along with the certificate of registration in original.

If the Board is satisfied, it may accept the request for surrender of certificate of registration within
thirty days of its receipt and upon acceptance, the registration of such insolvency professional shall
stand cancelled.

On and from the date of cancellation of certificate of registration, the concerned person shall not
represent itself to be a holder of the certificate for carrying out the activity for which such certificate
had been granted.

Special procedure for action on surrender, expulsion, etc.

While disposing of the matter under this regulation, the Board shall not be bound by the procedure
specified in regulation 11.

On receipt of information under clause (e) and (f) of sub-regulation (1) of regulation 10, the Board
may issue a notice, if required, to such professional member, calling upon it to explain as to why the
certificate of registration, granted under the regulations, should not be cancelled.

The professional member may make written submission(s), if any, within a period not exceeding
twenty-one days from the date of service of notice.

On being satisfied with the submission(s) made under sub-regulation (3), the Board may decide to
cancel the registration or issue directions to complete the ongoing assignments, make pending
compliances including payment of fee, etc.

The Board shall communicate its decision under sub-regulation (4) within thirty days from date of
receipt of written submissions under sub-regulation (3).

On receipt of information under clause (g) of sub-regulation (1) of regulation 10, the registration of
such insolvency professional with the Board shall be deemed to have been cancelled from the date of
demise or winding up or dissolution, as the case may be.

On and from the date of cancellation of the certificate of registration, under this regulation, the legal
heirs or assignee of the insolvency professional shall take steps for delivery of any record(s) or
document(s) or assets that may be in its custody or control, within the time period and in the manner,
as may be required under the relevant regulations or as may be directed by the Board.”

3. In the principal regulations, in Second Schedule, for Form A, the following form shall be substituted, namely: -

“FORM A
UNIFIED ENROLMENT AND REGISTRATION APPLICATION FORM

[Under Regulation 6 of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency Professionals) Regulations, 2016
and Regulation 10 of Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Model Bye- Laws and Governing Board of
Insolvency Professional Agencies) Regulations, 2016]

To
The Managing

<name of the insolvency professional agency>

Part -1
TO BE SUBMITTED BY THE APPLICANT

<Please affix a
recent passport
Director, size photo>

Subject: Application for enrolment as professional member and registration as an insolvency professional

Sir / Madam,

I hereby apply for -
(a) enrolment as a professional member with the <name of the insolvency professional agency> under
regulation 10 of Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Model Bye- Laws and Governing Board of
Insolvency Professional Agencies) Regulations, 2016; and



16 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

(b) registration as an insolvency professional under section 207 of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Code,
2016 read with regulation 6 of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency Professionals)
Regulations, 2016.

My details are as under:

A. PERSONAL DETAILS

1. Title (Mr. / Mrs. / Ms. / Other):
. Name (as per PAN / Aadhaar):
. Father’s Name:

. Mother’s Name:

. Date of Birth:

. Place of Birth:

PAN:

. AADHAAR No. (if available):
. Passport No. (if available):

10. GSTIN (if available):

11. DIN / DPIN (if available):

12. Address for Correspondence (Note: This shall be recorded as the registered address):

13. Permanent Address:
14. E-mail Address (Note: This shall be recorded as the registered e-mail address):
15. Mobile No. (Note: This shall be recorded as the registered mobile number):

16. Residential Status: Person resident in India/ Person resident outside India (strike off whichever is not applicable)
[in terms of section 3 (24) or 3 (25) of Insolvency and Bankruptcy Code, 2016]

B. EDUCATIONAL, PROFESSIONAL AND INSOLVENCY EXAMINATION QUALIFICATIONS
(i) Educational Qualifications

[Please provide educational qualifications from Bachelor’s degree onwards]

SI. No. Educational University Year of Marks Grade/ Remarks,
qualification /College Passing Secured Class if any
(%)
1) ) 3) 4) ®) (6) ()
(if) Professional Qualifications
[in terms of regulation 5(c)(iv) of IP Regulations]
Sl. No. Professional Institute/ Membership No. / Date of Remarks, if
Qualification Professional Enrolment No. (as the registration/ any
Body case may be) enrolment
@) ) ®) (4) ©) (6)




[T [1—=vE 4]

HTLT =T TSI AT

17

(iii) Insolvency Examinations

SI. No. | Name of the | Whether Name of the | Marks (%) | Date of | Remarks, if
examination qualified or | Institute/ /Grade/Class passing any
/programme not? Organisation (If applicable)

(Yes/ No)
1) ) ®) 4) ®) (6) )

1 Limited IBBI
Insolvency
Examination

2 Post  Graduate
Insolvency
Programme

3 National
Insolvency
Programme

(iv) Are you a registered valuer? (Yes/No) If yes,
(a) IBBI Registration No.
(b) Name of Registered Valuer Organisation (RVO) and,

(c) RVO Enrolment No.

C. WORK EXPERIENCE

(i) Are you presently in practice / employment? (Practice / Employment)

(ii) Total period in practice (years and completed months): yy / mm

(iii) Total period in employment (years and completed months): yy / mm

(iv) Details of experience (from the date of enrolment as an Advocate / Chartered Accountant/ Company Secretary /
Cost Accountant / After Bachelors’ Degree / After Master’ Degree / After Post Graduate Diploma)

SI. | From Date | To Date | Employment Practice Area of
No. | (dd-mm- (dd-mm- Work
yyYyy) yyyy) Name and | Designation Advocate/ Name of Firm
Address of CA/CS/ICMA | and Firm
Employer Registration
Number, if
applicable
1 1@ ®) (4) () (6) @) (8)

D. ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

1. Have you ever been convicted for an offence? (Yes / No)

If yes, please give complete along with current status.

2. Is any criminal proceedings pending against you? (Yes / No)

If yes, please give complete details along with current status.

3. Have you ever been adjudged as an insolvent/bankrupt, or applied to be declared so? (Yes / No) If yes, please give
complete details along with current status.

4. Is there any disciplinary proceeding pending against you or has been taken against you at any time in the preceding
three years by the ICAI, ICSI, ICAI (Cost), Bar Council or RVO?

(Yes /No)




18 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

If yes, please give complete details along with current status.
5. Have you ever applied for Enrolment with any Insolvency Professional Agency? (Yes / No)

If yes, please give details.

Date of application

Name of the IPA

Status of application

Reason of Rejection, if applicable

Date of Rejection, if applicable

6. Please provide any additional information that may be relevant for determining fit and proper person eligibility.
E. ATTACHMENTS

1. Copy of proof of residence

2. Copy of PAN card, Aadhaar card and Passport

3. Copy of GST Registration Certificate

4. Copy of DIN/ DPIN allotment letter

5. Copies of documents in support of educational qualification, professional qualification, and insolvency
examination.

6. Copies of documents demonstrating practice as —
(i) a chartered accountant registered with the Institute of Chartered Accountants of India;
(ii) a company secretary registered with the Institute of Company Secretaries of India;
(iii) a cost accountant registered with the Institute of Cost Accountants of India; or
(iv) an advocate enrolled with the Bar Council.
7. Copies of certificate of employment from the employer(s), specifying the period of such employment
8. Financial statements / Income-tax Returns for the last three years.
9. Copy of certificate of professional membership of Registered Valuer Organisation.
10. Evidence of deposit / payment of applicable fee.

11. Details of information with respect to conviction, criminal proceedings, insolvency/bankruptcy order, disciplinary
proceedings/actions, and any other additional information relevant for the application, as may be applicable (including
brief facts, copy of relevant orders and present status thereof) as separate enclosures.

F. UNDERSTANDING

I understand and agree that my enrolment with the <name of insolvency professional agency> and completion of pre-
registration educational course, subsequently, does not entitle me to the registration, which is subject to me complying
with requirements applicable under the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Code, 2016 read with the Insolvency and
Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency Professionals) Regulations, 2016.

G. AFFIRMATIONS

I affirm that | am eligible to be enrolled as a professional member under the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of
India (Model Bye-Laws and Governing Board of Insolvency Professional Agencies) Regulations, 2016 read with
sections 205 of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Code, 2016.

2. | affirm that the information furnished by me in this application is correct and complete to the best of my
knowledge and belief.

3. I undertake to comply with the requirements of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Code, 2016, rules, regulations,
guidelines and circulars issued thereunder, the bye-laws of the insolvency professional agency with which | am
enrolled, the resolutions passed, and directions given by the Board and the Governing Board of such insolvency
professional agency and to furnish any additional information as and when called for by the Board or Insolvency
Professional Agency.



[¢TRT [11—EUE 4] T T TSI © T 19

Name and signature of the applicant
Place:
Date:

Part - 11
TO BE SUBMITTED BY THE PROFESSIONAL MEMBER
[For the purposes of registration as an Insolvency Professional]

A. ENROLMENT WITH INSOLVENCY PROFESSIONAL AGENCY

(1) Professional Membership No./ Enrolment No.:

(2) Date of Enrolment:

B. PRE-REGISTRATION EDUCATIONAL COURSE

Have you completed the Pre-Registration Educational Course? (Yes/No)

If Yes, date of completion of Pre-Registration Educational Course: dd/mm/yyyy
C. FEE PAYMENT

Have you paid the non-refundable application fee to the Board within twelve months before the date of completion of
the Pre-Registration Educational Course? (Yes/No)

If Yes, date of payment of non-refundable application fee to the Board: dd/mm/yyyy
D. INFORMATION UPDATE

Do you wish to update the information submitted in Form A at the time of application seeking enrolment with the
Insolvency Professional Agency? (Yes/No)

E. AFFIRMATIONS

I affirm that | am eligible to be registered as an insolvency professional under the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board
of India (Insolvency Professionals) Regulations, 2016 read with section 207 of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Code,
2016.

2. | affirm that the information furnished by me in this application is correct and complete to the best of my
knowledge and belief.

3. | undertake to comply with the requirements of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Code, 2016, rules, regulations,
guidelines and circulars issued thereunder, the bye-laws of the insolvency professional agency with which | am
enrolled and directions given by the Board and the Governing Board of such insolvency professional agency and to
furnish any additional information as and when called for by the Board or Insolvency Professional Agency.

F. ATTACHMENTS

1. Copy of certificate of membership with an insolvency professional agency.

2. Copy of certificate of completion of pre-registration educational course.

3. Evidence of deposit / payment of applicable fee.

4. Copy of proof towards information updated in the Form A, wherever applicable.

Name and signature of applicant

Place:
Date:
Part - 111
TO BE SUBMITTED BY THE INSOLVENCY PROFESSIONAL AGENCY
[For the purposes of registration as an Insolvency Professional]
To,

The Executive Director (IP Division)

Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India



20 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

Subject: Application for registration as an insolvency professional
Sir / Madam,

The application for registration received from [Name of the applicant] after obtaining the membership
[Professional Membership Number], under section 207 of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Code, 2016 read with
regulation 6 of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency Professionals) Regulations, 2016 [IP

Regulations] is hereby submitted to the Board.

We have verified as under:

Sl Verification Finding
No.
1 Whether the applicant has submitted all the required details under | (Yes/ No)
Regulations 4 and 5 of IP regulations (as applicable) in its application | If No, please provide the
and completed the payment for registration as per requirement | details.
specified under Regulation 6 of IP Regulations?
2 Whether the professional member has completed the pre-registration | (Yes/No)
educational course within twelve months of making payment of | If Yes, give details and
application fee to the Board and obtained the completion certificate in | supporting document:
this regard? (Date of certificate)
3 Whether the insolvency professional agency has granted the | (Yes/No)
professional membership to the applicant after complying with | If Yes, give details and
eligibility requirement to become an insolvency professional? supporting document:
(Enrolment No)
(Date of Enrolment)
4 Whether any disciplinary proceedings are pending, or any disciplinary | Yes/ No.
action has been taken at any time in the preceding three years against
the professional member by the ICAI, ICSI, ICMAI, Bar Council or | If Yes, give details and
RVO of which applicant is a member. supporting document.
5 Whether a regulator ICAI, ICMAI, ICSI, or Bar Council has initiated | Yes/ No.
any criminal proceeding against the professional member and is
pending for disposal? If Yes, give details and
supporting document.
6 Whether the professional member had an unblemished service records | Yes/ No.
with the last employer if he was in employment?
If Yes, give details and
supporting document.
7 In case, DIN / DPIN has been furnished by the professional member, | Yes/ No.
whether the status thereof has been verified along with nature of
designation held by the professional member? If Yes, give details and
supporting document.
8 Whether the name of the professional member appears in the database | Yes/ No.
of Ministry of Corporate Affairs regarding:
i.  Directors disqualified under section 164 of the Companies Act, | If Yes, give details and
2013, or supporting document.
ii. Proclaimed Offenders under section 82 of the Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973.
9 Whether the professional member has been penalised by SEBI or CCI | Yes/ No.
in the last three years?
If Yes, give details and
supporting document.
10 Whether the name of professional member appears in the list of | Yes/No.
defaulters of RBI / Credit Information Company?




[¢TRT [11—EUE 4] T T TSI © T 21

If Yes, give details and
supporting document.
11 Whether the professional member has been convicted of any offence? Yes / No.

If Yes, give details and
supporting document.

We have verified the above details submitted by <name of the applicant> who is our professional member with
<professional membership no.> and confirm these to be true and correct. We recommend registration of <name of the
applicant> as an insolvency professional with IBBI.

(Name and Signature)
Authorised Officer of the Insolvency Professional Agency
(Seal of the Insolvency Professional Agency)

Place:
Date:

4. In principal regulations, in Second Schedule, for Form AA, the following form shall be substituted, namely: -
“FORM AA
UNIFIED ENROLMENT AND REGISTRATION APPLICATION FORM

[Under regulation 10 of Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Model Bye- Laws and Governing Board of
Insolvency Professional Agencies) Regulations, 2016 and Regulation 6 (1A) of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board
of India (Insolvency Professionals) Regulations, 2016]

Part— 1|
TO BE SUBMITTED BY THE APPLICANT
To
The Managing Director,
<Name of the Insolvency Professional Agency>
Subject: Application for enrolment as professional member and registration as insolvency professional
Sir/Madam,

I, being duly authorized for the purpose, hereby apply on behalf of [name of the applicant entity], recognised by the
Board as an insolvency professional entity with recognition number [recognition number], having registered address
at [registered address of the applicant entity]

| hereby apply for —

(i) enrolment as a professional member with the <name of the insolvency professional agency> under
regulation 10 of Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Model Bye- Laws and Governing Board of
Insolvency Professional Agencies) Regulations, 2016; and

(ii) registration as an insolvency professional under section 207 of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Code, 2016
read with regulation 6 (1A) of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency
Professionals) Regulations, 2016.

I hereby enclose proof (certified copy of Board/ Partner’s Resolution) that I am authorized to make this application
and correspond with the Board in this respect.

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

1. Whether the applicant entity is a subsidiary, joint venture or associate of another company or body corporate? (Yes/
No)

If yes, please give complete details of such company or body corporate.
2. Whether the applicant entity is undergoing or has undergone an insolvency resolution process? (Yes/ No)

If yes, please give complete details along with current status.



22 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

3. Whether the applicant entity is an undischarged bankrupt? (Yes/ No)

If yes, please give complete details along with current status.

4. Whether the applicant entity is a fit and proper person in terms of regulation 4(g) of IP Regulations? (Yes/ No)
If No, please give complete details along with current status.

5. Whether all the partners or directors, as the case may be, of the applicant entity are fit and proper person in terms of
regulation 4(g) of IP Regulations? (Yes/ No)

If No, please give complete details along with current status.
6. Please provide any additional information that may be relevant.
AFFIRMATIONS

1. 1, on behalf of [name of the applicant entity], affirm that the applicant entity has at all times complied with
regulations 12 and 13 of the IP Regulations.

2. 1, on behalf of [name of the applicant entity], affirm that the applicant entity is eligible to be enrolled as a
professional member with the insolvency professional agency.

3. 1, on behalf of [name of the applicant entity], hereby affirm that —
0] all information contained in this application is true and correct in all material respects,
(i) no material information relevant for the purpose of this application has been suppressed, and

(iii)  enrolment granted in pursuance of this application may be cancelled summarily if any information submitted
herein is found to be false or misleading in material respects at any stage.

4. 1, hereby confirm that the applicable fee has been paid to the agency vide [please enter the payment details along
with date of making the payment] and enclose proof thereof.

5. If granted certificate of membership, I, on behalf of [name of the applicant entity], undertake to comply with the
requirements of the Code, the rules, regulations or circulars or guidelines issued thereunder, and such other terms and
conditions as may be imposed by the Agency while granting the certificate of membership or subsequently.

Yours faithfully,

Authorized Signatory

(Name)

(Designation)

(Insolvency Professional Registration Number----------- )

(Name of the Insolvency Professional Entity-------- )

(Recognition Number of the Insolvency Professional Entity----)
Place:
Date:

ATTACHMENTS

1. Certified copy of Board / Partners’ Resolution authorising the person to make this application and correspond with
the Insolvency Professional Agency in this respect.

2. Copy of Certificate of Recognition issued by the Board.
3. Evidence of deposit / payment of applicable fee.
Part - 11
TO BE SUBMITTED BY THE PROFESSIONAL MEMBER

[For the purposes of registration as an Insolvency Professional]

INFORMATION UPDATE

1. Do you wish to update the information submitted in Form AA at the time of application seeking enrolment with the
IPA? (Yes/No)



[¢TRT [11—EUE 4] T T TSI © T 23

AFFIRMATIONS

1. 1, on behalf of [name of the insolvency professional entity], affirm that the insolvency professional entity has at all
times complied with regulations 12 and 13 of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency
Professionals) Regulations, 2016.

2. 1, on behalf of [name of the insolvency professional entity], affirm that the insolvency professional entity is eligible
to be registered as an insolvency professional with the Board.

3. 1, on behalf of [name of the insolvency professional entity], hereby affirm that —
(i)  all information contained in this application is true and correct in all material respects,
(i) no material information relevant for the purpose of this application has been suppressed, and

(iii) registration granted in pursuance of this application may be cancelled summarily if any information
submitted herein is found to be false or misleading in material respects at any stage.

(iv) the insolvency professional entity may be derecognised if any information submitted herein is found to be
false or misleading in material respects at any stage.

4. 1, hereby confirm that the applicable fee has been paid to the Board vide [please enter the payment details along
with date of making the payment] and enclose proof thereof.

5. If granted certificate of registration, I, on behalf of [name of the insolvency professional entity], undertake to
comply with the requirements of the Code, the rules, regulations or circulars or guidelines issued thereunder, and such
other terms and conditions as may be imposed by the Board while granting the certificate of registration or
subsequently.

Yours faithfully,

Authorized Signatory

(Name)

(Designation)

(Insolvency Professional Registration Number----------- )

(Name of the Insolvency Professional Entity-------- )

(Recognition Number of the Insolvency Professional Entity----)
Place:
Date:

ATTACHMENTS

1. Certified copy of Board / Partners’ Resolution authorising the person to make this application and correspond with
the Board in this respect.

2. Copy of Certificate of Membership issued by the Insolvency Professional Agency.
3. Evidence of deposit / payment of applicable fee.

4. Copy of proof towards information updated in the Form AA, wherever applicable.

Part - 111
TO BE SUBMITTED BY THE INSOLVENCY PROFESSIONAL AGENCY
[For the purposes of registration as an Insolvency Professional]
To,
The Executive Director (IP Division)

Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India



24 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

Subject: Application for registration as an insolvency professional
Sir / Madam,

The application for registration received from [Name of the professional member] after obtaining the
membership [Professional Membership Number], under section 207 of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Code, 2016
read with regulation 6 (LA) of the Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency Professionals) Regulations,
2016 is hereby submitted to the Board.

2. We have verified the details furnished by the professional member <name of the entity>, who is our professional
member with <professional membership no.>. We hereby confirm that: -

(i) the entity has number of partners or directors, as the case may be, as on the date of forwarding
application to the Board.

(ii) the entity complies with the eligibility requirements laid down under regulation 12 and 13 of the Insolvency
and Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency Professionals) Regulations, 2016.

3. We recommend registration of <name of the professional member> as an insolvency professional with the Board.
(Name and Signature)
Authorised Officer of the Insolvency Professional Agency
(Seal of the Insolvency Professional Agency).
Place:
Date: ”
RAVI MITAL, Chairperson
[ADVT.-11/4/Exty./425/2023-24]

Note : The Insolvency and Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency Professionals) Regulations, 2016 were published
vide notification No. IBBI/2016-17/GN/REG003 dated 23" November, 2016 in the Gazette of India,
Extraordinary, Part 111, Section 4, No. 424 on 23™ November, 2016 and were last amended by the Insolvency
and Bankruptcy Board of India (Insolvency Professionals) (Amendment) Regulations, 2023 published vide
notification No. IBBI/2023-24/GN/REG103, dated 20" July, 2023 in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part
11, Section 4, No. 507 on 20" July 2023.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. wawosxums ‘




		2023-09-19T19:11:26+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




